Company : Sol Infotech Pvt. Ltd.

mKUtChEhl’y Website : www.courtkutchehry.com

Karnataka Advocates Welfare Fund (Amendment) Act, 2002
18 of 2002

[06 September 2002]

CONTENTS

1. Short Title And Commencement
2. Amendment Of Section 2
3. Amendment Of Section 4
4. Amendment Of Section 6
5. Amendment Of Section 9
6
7
8

. Amendment Of Section 11

. Amendment Of Section 15

. Amendment Of Section 16
9. Amendment Of Section 22
10. Amendment Of Section 23
11. Amendment Of Section 23A

Karnataka Advocates Welfare Fund (Amendment) Act, 2002
18 of 2002
[06 September 2002]

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Advocate's Welfare Fund
Act, 1983. Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka
Advocate's Welfare Fund Act, 1983 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1985) for
the purposes hereinafter appearing; Be it enacted by the Karnataka
State Legislature in the fifty-third year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. Short Title And Commencement :-

(1) This Act may be called the Karnataka Advocates Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Act, 2002.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government

may by notification appoint and different dates may be appointed
for different provisions of this Act.

2. Amendment Of Section 2 :-

In section 2 of the Karnataka Advocates Welfare Fund Act, 1983



(Karnataka Act 2 of 1985) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act),-

(1) after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted, namely,-
"(d1) "chairman" means the chairman of the Trustee Committee;"
(2) in clause (e), for the words "unmarried minor" the word "minor"
shall be substituted.

(3) in clause (m), the words, figures and brackets "and includes
deemed voluntary suspension of practice referred to in sub-section
(4) of section 16" shall be inserted at the end.

3. Amendment Of Section 4 :-

In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),-

(i) for clauses (a) and (b), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

"(a) The Chairman of the Bar Council who shall be the chairman of
the Trustee Committee, ex-officio;

(aa) The Advocate General of Karnataka whoshall be a member-
Ex-officio.

(b) The Secretary, Department of Law, Government of Karnataka
who shall be a Member Ex-officio.

(ii) for clause (e), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

"(e) the Vice Chairman of the Bar Council who shall be the
Treasurer of the Trustee Committee -Ex-officio."

4. Amendment Of Section 6 :-

In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
"three months" the words "one month" shall be substituted.

5. Amendment Of Section 9 :-

In section 9 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (c),
for the words "five months" the words "three months" shall be
substituted.

6. Amendment Of Section 11 :-

In section 11 of the Principal Act, in clause (d), for the word
"Treasurer" the word "Chairman" shall be substituted.

7. Amendment Of Section 15 :-

In section 15 of the principal Act ,-



(1) in sub-section (1), the words, figures and brackets " other than
an Advocate coming under proviso to sub-section (5) of section 16"
shall be omitted;

(2) in sub-section (1 A), for the words "late fee of rupees ten per
month or part of a month subject to a maximum of rupees one
hundred" the words, "late fee of rupees twenty per month or part
of a month " shall be substituted.

8. Amendment Of Section 16 :-

In section 16 of the principal Act,-

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words "rupees one thousand" and
"rupees fifty thousand" the words " rupees three thousand" and
"rupees one lakh fifty thousand " shall, respectively be substituted;
(2) in sub-section (4), after the second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided also that an Advocate who is enrolled as an Advocate and
has become member after the First day of April, 1997 shall file
declarations in the prescribed form during the last month of fifth
and tenth year of his becoming member, failing which he shall be
deemed to have voluntarily suspended practice for the purpose of
this section immediately after the last date of the last month of
fifth year or tenth year, as the case may be."

(3) in sub-section (5),-

(a) for the words "rupees fifty thousand" the words "rupees one
lakh and fifty thousand" shall be substituted;

(b) in the proviso, the following shall be inserted at the end,
namely:-

"but such member shall be paid an amount at the rate of rupees
two thousand for every completed year of practice".

9. Amendment Of Section 22 :-

In section 22 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words"
five rupees" the words "five rupees or ten rupees" shall be
substituted.

10. Amendment Of Section 23 :-

In section 23 of the principal Act,

(1) In sub-section (1), for the words "one welfare fund stamp" the
words "welfare fund stamps of the value of rupees ten" shall be
substituted.



(2) After sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, namely:-
"(1A) Every Advocate shall affix welfare fund stamp of rupees five
on every interim application filed in all the proceedings".

1. Amendment Of Section 23A :-

(1) In section 23A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the
words "rupees two thousand five hundred per year" the words"
rupees five thousand in every financial year" shall be substituted;
(2) in sub-section (2), for the words "rupees twenty five per month
or part of a month subject to a maximum of rupees five hundred"
the words" rupees two hundred and fifty per month or part of a
month" shall be substituted.



